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PROPERTY

For Sale - Lot #16 Cornelius
Road. Pad down and ready to
go. 907-518-1281.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .4x3-16b13

Building lots - Water views or
panoramic mountain views.
Residential lots with sunny
southern exposure. Call 907-
518-1281.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn6-23b16

FOR RENT

Dockside/Lewis Apartments.
Updated 2 bed/1 bath units in-
cludes washer/dryer in well
maintained 6-unit building.
$1050/$950/month. Email ccll-
cak@gmail.com for application
and details or call 907-247-
1902.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .2x3-9b23

Space for rent for single wide
mobile home. Close to town.
907-518-1281.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .4x3-9b12

3br/2ba apt for rent $1200.00 +
utilities. Located on Cornelius.
518-0651.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn10-13b9

Rooms and kitchenettes avail-
able at the Narrows. Utilities in-
cluded. $500/month and up.
772-4270.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn11-19b14

Beachcomber Inn: Weekly and
monthly rentals available. Com-
pletely furnished apartments,
kitchenettes and rooms. 772-
3888.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn11-11b14

CLASSES

The Petersburg Indian Associ-
ation will be hosting a basic in-
troduction to Microsoft Office
on March 28-30 from 8:30am –

4:00pm.  The course is open to
the public; free to all PIA Tribal
Members and a small fee for
non-tribal members.  Seating is
limited; call PIA at 907-772-
3636 to reserve a seat or request
further information.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .2x3-16b54

JOBS

Position Openings for Home
Health Agency Manager.  The
HH Manager promotes and pre-
serves the health and indepen-
dence of clients in their home
setting; follows Medicare regu-
lations to evaluate, plan and
treat eligible patients. Develops
and implements a plan of care
in collaboration with the client,
family, physician and appropri-
ate therapists. Follows plan of
care, evaluates outcomes and
makes changes as needed.  Doc-
uments into Oasis system and
transmits information to CMS.
HH Manager must be a regis-
tered nurse in the State of Alas-
ka, BSN preferred. Two years of
clinical nursing experience,
with at least one of those years
in an acute care or skilled nurs-
ing facility. Preferably one year
of experience in public health or
home health. The HH Manager
is a scheduled part time, 20
hours per week position with
some benefits. Position closes
on Monday, March 27th, at 5
p.m.  Applications available on
line at www.pmcak.org or at
PMC.  For more information,
call Cindy Newman at (907)
772-4291, extension 5719.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .3x3-23b161

Petersburg Indian Association
is hiring for a residential facili-
ties maintenance mechanic. The
position requires a valid AK dri-
ver’s license, housing mainte-
nance skills, general carpentry
experience and knowledge of
computers. 30 hours per week.
Pay DOE. Candidate should be
able to demonstrate the ability
to work on their own.  Prefer-
ence will be given to native ap-
plicants. Applications are avail-
able at  PIA 15 N. Twelfth St or
call Angela Davis 907-772-
3636.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .3x3-23b69

Part time, Cocktail Waitress,
must be able to obtain food
servers cards and tips. Willing
to train. Wages DOE, apply at
Elks Lodge, 772-4601
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .2x3-16b24

Exp. Bookkeeper needed, 30+
hours/week, must have exp in
QB, be a self starter and moti-
vated and able to multi task.
Pay DOE. Email resume to
cdillc@hotmail.com or call
518-0651.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .3x3-16b31

Scandia House is now accept-
ing applications for Front Desk
personnel. Must have strong
customer service and office
skills. Apply at hotel. 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn2-23b21

Phoenix Logging is now taking
numbers for all logging, road
building, and mechanic posi-
tions. Multi-year contract at re-
mote site on Prince of Wales Is-
land in SE Alaska. New land-
based camp with TV, Phones,
Internet. Health care, 401K, top
wages plus overtime, and em-
ployers who care. 907-225-2180
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .8x4-6b46

SERVICES

Tax season is here. E-file your
tax return and get your 
refund fast. Appointments avail-
able. 480-235-1374 or 907-772-
2889.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn1-12b18

BOATS AND SUPPLIES

For Sale: 2002 B&W 10' X 6'
In-Vessel Composter and feed-

ing belt. PIA is asking $4000 or
best offer by March 17, 2017.
Address offers to PIA, PO Box
1418, Petersburg 99833 Atten:
Brandon or call 907-772-3636.
PIA has the right to reject any
offers. 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .3x3-9b43

IFQ’s and Fishing permits,
Alaskan quota and permits,
907-772-4000/1-888-347-4437.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn7-16b15

MOTOR VEHICLES

1992 Yamaha Bravo snowmo-
bile.Runs great, $1,500. Ron,
772-9393 or 518-1180.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn1-26dh

MISCELLANEOUS

Classified deadline is 5 p.m.
each Tuesday for ads appearing
in Thursday’s paper. Call 772-
9393 or drop by at 207 N.
Nordic Drive.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1x3-9dh

Office supplies available at Pe-
tersburg Pilot. Paper and pens to
crayons. We’ve got it all. 207 N.
Nordic Drive.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1x3-9dh

NOTICES

Sons of Norway Bingo, Friday
nights 7 p.m. Doors open at 6
p.m. Must be 19 to play.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .tfn12-08b18


